
CITY OF WOOSTER
SOUTH STREET AND N. BAUER ROAD WATERLINE REPLACEMENT PROJECTS
BID TABULATIONS
BID DATE:   DECEMBER 2, 2021

BIDDER

NAME :

ODOT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT 

ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1A 202 CURB BOX REMOVED 14 EACH 1.00$           14.00$           15.00$        210.00$         25.00$         350.00$         45.00$           630.00$         No bid No bid

1B 202 VALVE BOX REMOVED 10 EACH 50.00$         500.00$         150.00$      1,500.00$      50.00$         500.00$         145.00$         1,450.00$      No bid No bid

1C 202 FIRE HYDRANT REMOVED 4 EACH 100.00$       400.00$         150.00$      600.00$         550.00$       2,200.00$      1,105.00$      4,420.00$      No bid No bid

1D 202 PAVEMENT REMOVED 19 SY 10.00$         190.00$         20.00$        380.00$         10.00$         190.00$         36.00$           684.00$         No bid No bid

1E 202 WALK REMOVED 760 SF 1.00$           760.00$         1.50$          1,140.00$      2.00$           1,520.00$      1.50$             1,140.00$      No bid No bid

1F 202 CURB REMOVED 117 FT 2.00$           234.00$         5.00$          585.00$         10.00$         1,170.00$      25.00$           2,925.00$      No bid No bid

2A 638 6" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 137 FT 100.00$       13,700.00$    90.00$        12,330.00$    116.00$       15,892.00$    123.00$         16,851.00$    No bid No bid

2B 638 8" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 111 FT 90.00$         9,990.00$      110.00$      12,210.00$    158.00$       17,538.00$    175.00$         19,425.00$    No bid No bid

2C 638 12" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 1190 FT 100.00$       119,000.00$  125.00$      148,750.00$  138.00$       164,220.00$  139.00$         165,410.00$  No bid No bid

2D 638 12" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS (CONCRETE ENCASED) 32 FT 150.00$       4,800.00$      190.00$      6,080.00$      213.00$       6,816.00$      275.00$         8,800.00$      No bid No bid

3 638 RAILROAD CROSSING BY BORING & JACKING 1 LS 70,000.00$  70,000.00$    75,000.00$  75,000.00$    64,520.00$  64,520.00$    113,420.00$  113,420.00$  No bid No bid

4A 638 6" GATE VALVE AND BOX 6 EACH 1,250.00$    7,500.00$      1,700.00$   10,200.00$    1,675.00$    10,050.00$    1,660.00$      9,960.00$      No bid No bid

4B 638 8" GATE VALVE AND BOX 3 EACH 1,750.00$    5,250.00$      1,975.00$   5,925.00$      2,070.00$    6,210.00$      2,042.00$      6,126.00$      No bid No bid

4C 638 12" GATE VALVE AND BOX 4 EACH 3,000.00$    12,000.00$    3,000.00$   12,000.00$    3,620.00$    14,480.00$    3,185.00$      12,740.00$    No bid No bid

5 638 FIRE HYDRANT 4 EACH 4,250.00$    17,000.00$    4,500.00$   18,000.00$    4,260.00$    17,040.00$    4,043.00$      16,172.00$    No bid No bid

6A 638 1" COPPER WATER SERVICE LINE 352 FT 25.00$         8,800.00$      20.00$        7,040.00$      21.00$         7,392.00$      51.00$           17,952.00$    No bid No bid

6B 638 2" COPPER WATER SERVICE LINE 7 FT 50.00$         350.00$         35.00$        245.00$         81.00$         567.00$         268.00$         1,876.00$      No bid No bid

6C 638 1" CORPORATION STOP 12 EACH 200.00$       2,400.00$      400.00$      4,800.00$      337.00$       4,044.00$      137.00$         1,644.00$      No bid No bid

6D 638 2" CORPORATION STOP AND SERVICE SADDLE 1 EACH 650.00$       650.00$         950.00$      950.00$         1,500.00$    1,500.00$      900.00$         900.00$         No bid No bid

6E 638 1" CURB STOP AND BOX 12 EACH 500.00$       6,000.00$      400.00$      4,800.00$      575.00$       6,900.00$      375.00$         4,500.00$      No bid No bid

6F 638 2" CURB STOP AND BOX 1 EACH 1,000.00$    1,000.00$      700.00$      700.00$         1,770.00$    1,770.00$      936.00$         936.00$         No bid No bid

6G 638 1" COUPLING 12 EACH 50.00$         600.00$         2.00$          24.00$           3.00$           36.00$           50.00$           600.00$         No bid No bid

6H 638 3/4" x 1" COUPLING 12 EACH 50.00$         600.00$         2.00$          24.00$           3.00$           36.00$           50.00$           600.00$         No bid No bid

6I 638 2" COUPLING 1 EACH 50.00$         50.00$           2.00$          2.00$             171.00$       171.00$         180.00$         180.00$         No bid No bid

6J 638 TWO BOLT DRESSER COUPLING 12 EACH 50.00$         600.00$         2.00$          24.00$           3.00$           36.00$           70.00$           840.00$         No bid No bid

7 452 6" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CLASS QC MS 19 SY 80.00$         1,520.00$      60.00$        1,140.00$      72.00$         1,368.00$      108.00$         2,052.00$      No bid No bid

8 608 4" CONCRETE WALK 760 SF 6.00$           4,560.00$      5.50$          4,180.00$      5.00$           3,800.00$      8.00$             6,080.00$      No bid No bid

9 609 CURB, TYPE 6 117 FT 35.00$         4,095.00$      20.00$        2,340.00$      25.00$         2,925.00$      37.00$           4,329.00$      No bid No bid

10 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 LS 5,437.00$    5,437.00$      5,000.00$   5,000.00$      2,300.00$    2,300.00$      9,000.00$      9,000.00$      No bid No bid

11 632 DETECTOR LOOP 1 EACH 5,000.00$    5,000.00$      3,000.00$   3,000.00$      2,500.00$    2,500.00$      2,700.00$      2,700.00$      No bid No bid

12 SPECIAL TEMPORARY PAVEMENT 400 SY 5.00$           2,000.00$      5.00$          2,000.00$      5.00$           2,000.00$      20.00$           8,000.00$      No bid No bid
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1A 202 CURB BOX REMOVED 6 EACH 100.00$       600.00$         10.00$        60.00$           25.00$         150.00$         46.00$           276.00$         106.00$       636.00$         

1B 202 VALVE BOX REMOVED 2 EACH 150.00$       300.00$         75.00$        150.00$         50.00$         100.00$         155.00$         310.00$         197.00$       394.00$         

2A 638 6" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 45 FT 95.00$         4,275.00$      110.00$      4,950.00$      102.00$       4,590.00$      160.00$         7,200.00$      98.50$         4,432.50$      

2B 638 8" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 1,042 FT 100.00$       104,200.00$  90.00$        93,780.00$    83.00$         86,486.00$    75.00$           78,150.00$    99.40$         103,574.80$  

3A 638 6" GATE VALVE AND BOX 2 EACH 1,250.00$    2,500.00$      1,500.00$   3,000.00$      1,675.00$    3,350.00$      1,552.00$      3,104.00$      1,606.00$    3,212.00$      

3B 638 8" GATE VALVE AND BOX 4 EACH 2,250.00$    9,000.00$      1,700.00$   6,800.00$      2,070.00$    8,280.00$      1,988.00$      7,952.00$      2,139.00$    8,556.00$      

4 638 8"x12" TAPPING SLEEVE 1 EACH 4,000.00$    4,000.00$      3,200.00$   3,200.00$      3,700.00$    3,700.00$      2,100.00$      2,100.00$      4,961.00$    4,961.00$      

5 638 WATERLINE  DISCONNECTION 1 EACH 2,500.00$    2,500.00$      1,800.00$   1,800.00$      1,650.00$    1,650.00$      1,389.00$      1,389.00$      569.00$       569.00$         

6 638 FIRE HYDRANT 2 EACH 4,500.00$    9,000.00$      4,000.00$   8,000.00$      4,230.00$    8,460.00$      4,260.00$      8,520.00$      6,030.00$    12,060.00$    

7A 638 1" COPPER WATER SERVICE LINE 177 FT 25.00$         4,425.00$      25.00$        4,425.00$      22.00$         3,894.00$      48.00$           8,496.00$      58.50$         10,354.50$    

7B 638 1" CORPORATION STOP 6 EACH 500.00$       3,000.00$      400.00$      2,400.00$      340.00$       2,040.00$      137.00$         822.00$         284.00$       1,704.00$      

7C 638 1" CURB STOP AND BOX 6 EACH 250.00$       1,500.00$      400.00$      2,400.00$      585.00$       3,510.00$      375.00$         2,250.00$      513.00$       3,078.00$      

7D 638 1" COUPLING 6 EACH 50.00$         300.00$         2.00$          12.00$           3.00$           18.00$           50.00$           300.00$         151.00$       906.00$         

7E 638 3/4" x 1" COUPLING 6 EACH 50.00$         300.00$         3.00$          18.00$           3.00$           18.00$           50.00$           300.00$         95.00$         570.00$         

7F 638 TWO BOLT DRESSER COUPLING 6 EACH 50.00$         300.00$         2.00$          12.00$           3.00$           18.00$           70.00$           420.00$         75.00$         450.00$         

8 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 LS 2,800.00$    2,800.00$      3,000.00$   3,000.00$      1,500.00$    1,500.00$      19,139.00$    19,139.00$    3,750.00$    3,750.00$      

9 SPECIAL TEMPORARY PAVEMENT 200 SY 5.00$           1,000.00$      2.00$          400.00$         5.00$           1,000.00$      20.00$           4,000.00$      2.50$           500.00$         

150,000.00$  

CONTINGENCIES 10% 15,000.00$    

CONTRACT A: SOUTH STREET 305,000.00$  341,179.00$  360,041.00$  442,342.00$  No Bid

CONTRACT B: N. BAUER ROAD 134,407.00$  128,764.00$  144,728.00$  159,707.80$  

TOTAL A & B 475,586.00$  488,805.00$  587,070.00$  No Bid

COMBINATION BID PRICE 470,000.00$  475,586.00$  480,000.00$  572,070.00$  No Bid

Bond Yes Bond Yes Bond Yes Bond Yes
Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes
ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes

CONTRACT B: N. BAUER ROAD
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