
CITY OF WOOSTER
REFUSE, RECYCLABLE AND YARD WASTE SERVICE
BID TABULATIONS
BID DATE:  01/15/2020

BIDDER

NAME :

UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH

Solid Waste Collection

1 Option 1: Solid Waste Collection Bid - rolling container, weekly collection 8,500 per residence per month 8.79$                       74,715.00$              9.71$                       82,535.00$              12.17$                     103,445.00$            12.62$                     107,270.00$            

Size of rolling container 96 Gallon 95 Gallon 96 Gallon 96 Gallon

2
Option 2: Solid Waste Collection Bid - rolling container, weekly collection plus up to eight 30-
gallon bags plus one bulk item per month 8,500 per residence per month 9.82$                       83,470.00$              10.26$                     87,210.00$              12.73$                     108,205.00$            No Bid No Bid

Size of rolling container 96 Gallon 95 Gallon 96 Gallon

Recyclable Materials Collection

3 Option 1: Recyclable Collection Bid - rolling container, weekly collection 8,500 per residence per month 6.13$                       52,105.00$              6.81$                       57,885.00$              6.62$                       56,270.00$              8.81$                       74,885.00$              

Size of rolling container 65 Gallon 65 Gallon 65 Gallon 64 Gallon

4 Option 2: Recyclable Collection Bid - rolling container, bi-weekly collection 8,500 per residence per month 4.43$                       37,655.00$              6.73$                       57,205.00$              4.25$                       36,125.00$              5.20$                       44,200.00$              

Size of rolling container 65 Gallon 95 Gallon 65 Gallon 64 Gallon

Required: Municipal Operations

5 Twice weekly collection of Downtown trash containers 67 Per Can per Week 13.65$                     914.55$                   8.57$                       574.19$                   10.20$                     683.40$                   2.91$                       194.97$                   

6 8 yd. Dumpster Weekly Collection 1 EA 108.00$                   108.00$                   85.00$                     85.00$                     110.00$                   110.00$                   40.00$                     40.00$                     

7 8 yd. Dumpster, twice Weekly Collection 1 EA 214.00$                   214.00$                   170.00$                   170.00$                   195.00$                   195.00$                   72.50$                     72.50$                     

8 8 yd. Dumpster 3 times Weekly Collection 1 EA 320.00$                   320.00$                   255.00$                   255.00$                   279.00$                   279.00$                   140.00$                   140.00$                   

9 8 yd. Dumpster, Daily Collection 1 EA 540.00$                   540.00$                   425.00$                   425.00$                   490.00$                   490.00$                   170.00$                   170.00$                   

10 6 yd. Dumpster Weekly Collection 1 EA 84.00$                     84.00$                     65.00$                     65.00$                     88.00$                     88.00$                     34.50$                     34.50$                     

11 6 yd. Dumpster, twice Weekly Collection 1 EA 168.00$                   168.00$                   130.00$                   130.00$                   166.00$                   166.00$                   63.75$                     63.75$                     

12 6 yd. Dumpster 3 times Weekly Collection 1 EA 252.00$                   252.00$                   195.00$                   195.00$                   234.00$                   234.00$                   93.00$                     93.00$                     

13 6 yd. Dumpster, Daily Collection 1 EA 420.00$                   420.00$                   325.00$                   325.00$                   400.00$                   400.00$                   153.75$                   153.75$                   

14 4 yd. Dumpster, Weekly Collection 1 EA 72.00$                     72.00$                     55.00$                     55.00$                     70.00$                     70.00$                     29.75$                     29.75$                     

15 4 yd. Dumpster, twice Weekly Collection 1 EA 144.00$                   144.00$                   110.00$                   110.00$                   125.00$                   125.00$                   55.75$                     55.75$                     

16 4 yd. Dumpster, Daily Collection 1 EA 340.00$                   340.00$                   275.00$                   275.00$                   335.00$                   335.00$                   135.00$                   135.00$                   

17 2 yd. Dumpster, Weekly Collection 1 EA 58.00$                     58.00$                     45.00$                     45.00$                     55.00$                     55.00$                     29.75$                     29.75$                     

18 2 yd. Dumpster, twice Weekly Collection 1 EA 116.00$                   116.00$                   90.00$                     90.00$                     110.00$                   110.00$                   55.75$                     55.75$                     

19 2 yd. Dumpster, Daily Collection 1 EA 290.00$                   290.00$                   225.00$                   225.00$                   275.00$                   275.00$                   135.00$                   135.00$                   

20 Container – 1 Collection — 20 yd. 1 Per Dump 455.00$                   455.00$                   250.00$                   250.00$                   345.00$                   345.00$                   550.00$                   550.00$                   

21 Container – 1 Collection — 30 yd. 1 Per Dump 492.00$                   492.00$                   250.00$                   250.00$                   385.00$                   385.00$                   610.00$                   610.00$                   

22 Cleanup of animal remains as needed 1 Flat Rate No Charge No Charge 100.00$                   100.00$                   Flate Rate Included No Bid No Bid

Waste Management of Ohio, Inc.Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. Republic Services of OhioKimble Recycling &

Disposal, Inc. Hauling, Inc.ESTIMATE
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Required: Annual Municipal / Special Events Quote:

23 Wooster Relay for Life: (5) 8 yd. containers & (30) disposable / event boxes

Wooster Fourth of July: (50) disposable / event boxes

Main Street Wooster Kids day: (1) 8 yd. container
Wooster Fire Fighters Local 764 Aluminum Can Drive: (1) 8 yd. container and transportation to 
recycling facility.
Taste of Downtown Wooster: (1) 8 yd. container with (2) pickups and  (24) event boxes

Wooster Italian Fest: (3) 8 yd. containers and (20) event boxes 

Main Street Wooster Jaz Fest: (1) 8 yd. container.

Main Street Wooster Concert Cruise I: (1) 8 yd. container

Main Street Wooster Concert Cruise II: (1) 8 yd. container

Woosterfest: (5) 8 yd. containers, (1) 30 yd. recycling, and (25) event boxes

Provide 30 event boxes for City Inventory 1 Annual Price 6,258.00$                6,258.00$                5,570.00$                5,570.00$                2,950.00$                2,950.00$                Included Included

Fuel Adjustment Methodology

Option A: Standard Yes Yes Yes

Option B: No Adjustment Yes -$                         

Bond Evergreen National Bond Evergreen National Bond Evergreen National Bond Western Surety
ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes
Addenda Yes Addenda Yes Addenda Yes Addenda Yes
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