
CITY OF WOOSTER
WOODCREST DRIVE WATERLINE REPLACEMENT AND CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIRS
BID TABULATIONS
BID DATE:    MARCH 8, 2019

BIDDER

NAME :

ODOT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT 

ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1A 202 CURB BOX REMOVED 50 EA $75.00 3,750.00$            25.00$        1,250.00$       50.00$        2,500.00$       1.00$            50.00$            30.00$          1,500.00$       95.00$        4,750.00$       25.00$          1,250.00$          35.00$        1,750.00$       89.00$        4,450.00$       

1B 202 VALVE BOX REMOVED 21 EA $150.00 3,150.00$            50.00$        1,050.00$       150.00$      3,150.00$       20.00$          420.00$          50.00$          1,050.00$       190.00$      3,990.00$       28.00$          588.00$             100.00$      2,100.00$       140.00$      2,940.00$       

1C 202 FIRE HYDRANT REMOVED 6 EA $400.00 2,400.00$            150.00$      900.00$          600.00$      3,600.00$       300.00$        1,800.00$       5.00$            30.00$            355.00$      2,130.00$       200.00$        1,200.00$          450.00$      2,700.00$       446.00$      2,676.00$       

1D 202 PAVEMENT REMOVED 1030 SY $9.00 9,270.00$            5.00$          5,150.00$       3.00$          3,090.00$       6.00$            6,180.00$       5.00$            5,150.00$       14.32$        14,749.60$     2.00$            2,060.00$          2.00$          2,060.00$       12.50$        12,875.00$     

1E 202 CURB REMOVED 189 FT $4.00 756.00$               5.00$          945.00$          5.00$          945.00$          1.00$            189.00$          5.00$            945.00$          7.73$          1,460.97$       2.00$            378.00$             4.00$          756.00$          6.00$          1,134.00$       

2A 638 6" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 119 FT $100.00 11,900.00$          92.00$        10,948.00$     148.00$      17,612.00$     66.00$          7,854.00$       80.25$          9,549.75$       105.53$      12,558.07$     105.00$        12,495.00$        85.70$        10,198.30$     79.70$        9,484.30$       

2B 638 8" CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE & FITTINGS 2578 FT $84.00 216,552.00$        69.00$        177,882.00$   110.00$      283,580.00$   96.00$          247,488.00$   100.15$        258,186.70$   81.04$        208,921.12$   82.00$          211,396.00$      77.72$        200,362.16$   86.00$        221,708.00$   

3A 638 6" GATE VALVE AND BOX 7 EA $1,000.00 7,000.00$            1,300.00$   9,100.00$       1,200.00$   8,400.00$       950.00$        6,650.00$       1,000.00$     7,000.00$       1,165.00$   8,155.00$       1,100.00$     7,700.00$          1,035.08$   7,245.56$       1,220.00$   8,540.00$       

3B 638 8" GATE VALVE AND BOX 14 EA $1,500.00 21,000.00$          1,600.00$   22,400.00$     1,500.00$   21,000.00$     1,300.00$     18,200.00$     1,400.00$     19,600.00$     1,522.58$   21,316.12$     1,400.00$     19,600.00$        1,422.85$   19,919.90$     1,897.00$   26,558.00$     

4 638 FIRE HYDRANT 7 EA $4,500.00 31,500.00$          3,200.00$   22,400.00$     3,200.00$   22,400.00$     3,850.00$     26,950.00$     5,000.00$     35,000.00$     4,392.21$   30,745.47$     2,800.00$     19,600.00$        2,607.58$   18,253.06$     4,450.00$   31,150.00$     

5A 638 1" COPPER WATER SERVICE LINE 1287 FT $25.00 32,175.00$          22.00$        28,314.00$     55.00$        70,785.00$     16.00$          20,592.00$     6.00$            7,722.00$       58.17$        74,864.79$     26.00$          33,462.00$        32.36$        41,647.32$     37.20$        47,876.40$     

5B 638 1" CORPORATION STOP 50 EA $350.00 17,500.00$          165.00$      8,250.00$       125.00$      6,250.00$       700.00$        35,000.00$     480.00$        24,000.00$     417.14$      20,857.00$     300.00$        15,000.00$        239.39$      11,969.50$     695.00$      34,750.00$     

5C 638 1" CURB STOP AND BOX 50 EA 300.00$      15,000.00$          400.00$      20,000.00$     200.00$      10,000.00$     800.00$        40,000.00$     590.00$        29,500.00$     577.25$      28,862.50$     450.00$        22,500.00$        264.48$      13,224.00$     724.00$      36,200.00$     

5D 638 1" COUPLING 50 EA 20.00$        1,000.00$            5.00$          250.00$          26.00$        1,300.00$       30.00$          1,500.00$       30.00$          1,500.00$       59.54$        2,977.00$       5.00$            250.00$             28.04$        1,402.00$       62.00$        3,100.00$       

5E 638 3/4" x 1" UNION 50 EA 20.00$        1,000.00$            5.00$          250.00$          21.00$        1,050.00$       25.00$          1,250.00$       45.00$          2,250.00$       54.25$        2,712.50$       5.00$            250.00$             22.75$        1,137.50$       62.00$        3,100.00$       

5F 638 1" UNION 50 EA 20.00$        1,000.00$            5.00$          250.00$          20.00$        1,000.00$       24.00$          1,200.00$       22.00$          1,100.00$       54.02$        2,701.00$       5.00$            250.00$             22.52$        1,126.00$       62.00$        3,100.00$       

5G 638 TWO BOLT DRESSER COUPLING 50 EA 50.00$        2,500.00$            5.00$          250.00$          30.00$        1,500.00$       40.00$          2,000.00$       50.00$          2,500.00$       72.63$        3,631.50$       5.00$            250.00$             41.13$        2,056.50$       62.00$        3,100.00$       

6 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 LS 4,000.00$   4,000.00$            5,500.00$   5,500.00$       5,000.00$   5,000.00$       16,750.00$   16,750.00$     9,000.00$     9,000.00$       1,811.22$   1,811.22$       15,000.00$   15,000.00$        2,500.00$   2,500.00$       9,459.00$   9,459.00$       

7 SPEC TEMPORARY PAVEMENT 1,030 SY 7.00$          7,210.00$            5.00$          5,150.00$       11.00$        11,330.00$     4.00$            4,120.00$       3.50$            3,605.00$       8.69$          8,950.70$       1.50$            1,545.00$          9.77$          10,063.10$     3.20$          3,296.00$       

NO BID #1 320,239.00$   #8 474,492.00$   #5 438,193.00$   #4 419,188.45$   #6 456,144.56$   #3 364,774.00$      NO BID #2 350,470.90$   NO BID #7 465,496.70$   

8A 202 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT REMOVED 1,030 SY 4.00$          4,120.00$            12.00$        12,360.00$     4.00$          4,120.00$       1.00$            1,030.00$       1.50$            1,545.00$       7.00$          7,210.00$       7.55$          7,776.50$       2.00$          2,060.00$       7.80$          8,034.00$              1.00$          1,030.00$       

8B 202 CURB REMOVED 450 FT 4.00$          1,800.00$            6.00$          2,700.00$       5.00$          2,250.00$       3.00$            1,350.00$       5.00$            2,250.00$       6.50$          2,925.00$       6.50$          2,925.00$       4.00$          1,800.00$       2.50$          1,125.00$              3.40$          1,530.00$       

9A 255 FULL DEPTH PAVEMENT SAWING 4,070 FT 2.00$          8,140.00$            1.35$          5,494.50$       2.00$          8,140.00$       1.70$            6,919.00$       2.00$            8,140.00$       1.40$          5,698.00$       1.25$          5,087.50$       1.40$          5,698.00$       2.25$          9,157.50$              3.00$          12,210.00$     

9B 255 FULL DEPTH PAVEMENT REMOVAL AND RIGID REPLACEMENT, CLASS QC MS 1,163 SY 90.00$        104,670.00$        89.00$        103,507.00$   75.00$        87,225.00$     82.00$          95,366.00$     136.65$        158,923.95$   75.00$        87,225.00$     77.00$        89,551.00$     80.05$        93,098.15$     68.80$        80,014.40$            82.20$        95,598.60$     

10A 452 6" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CLASS QC MS 14 SY 80.00$        1,120.00$            80.00$        1,120.00$       50.00$        700.00$          63.00$          882.00$          126.65$        1,773.10$       70.00$        980.00$          52.00$        728.00$          67.20$        940.80$          63.80$        893.20$                 64.40$        901.60$          

10B 452 8" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CLASS QC MS 1,030 SY 77.00$        79,310.00$          81.00$        83,430.00$     70.00$        72,100.00$     81.00$          83,430.00$     126.65$        130,449.50$   54.00$        55,620.00$     58.00$        59,740.00$     77.80$        80,134.00$     65.00$        66,950.00$            71.00$        73,130.00$     

11 609 CURB, TYPE 2-A 509 FT 15.00$        7,635.00$            6.00$          3,054.00$       18.00$        9,162.00$       4.00$            2,036.00$       3.00$            1,527.00$       10.00$        5,090.00$       10.00$        5,090.00$       16.05$        8,169.45$       12.50$        6,362.50$              23.20$        11,808.80$     

12 611 SANITARY MANHOLE ADJUSTED TO GRADE 1 EA 750.00$      750.00$               250.00$      250.00$          550.00$      550.00$          500.00$        500.00$          300.00$        300.00$          350.00$      350.00$          500.00$      500.00$          500.00$      500.00$          650.00$      650.00$                 657.00$      657.00$          

13 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 LS 3,792.00$   3,792.00$            2,000.00$   2,000.00$       5,500.00$   5,500.00$       2,930.00$     2,930.00$       15,000.00$   15,000.00$     2,550.00$   2,550.00$       7,500.00$   7,500.00$       2,000.00$   2,000.00$       600.00$      600.00$                 6,057.00$   6,057.00$       

#8 213,915.50$   #4 189,747.00$   NO BID #6 194,443.00$   #9 319,908.55$   #1 167,648.00$   NO BID #3 178,898.00$   #5 194,400.40$   #2 173,786.60$          #7 202,923.00$   

600,000.00$        

CONTINGENCIES 10% 60,000.00$          

TOTAL BIDS A & B N/A 509,986.00$   N/A 632,636.00$   739,097.00$   623,792.56$   N/A N/A 544,871.30$   N/A 668,419.70$   

COMBINATION BID (or total of A + B) N/A #1 482,650.00$   N/A #4 632,636.00$   #6 739,024.55$   #3 573,845.00$   N/A N/A #2 544,871.30$   N/A #5 639,727.00$   

GRAND TOTAL 660,000.00$        

Bond West Bend Bond Granite Re Bond Travelers Bond Merchants Bond Ohio Farmers Bond Old Republic Bond Employers Mutual Bond Ohio Farmers Bond Western Surety Bond Auto Owners Mutual Bond Hartford
Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes Subs List Yes
ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes ORC 3517.13 Yes

ESTIMATE

Stout ExcavatingNieman Excavating Wenger ExcavatingENGINEER'S Lockhart Concrete Smith Paving & ExcavatingDirt Dawg Excavating Elite Excavating

Notes:
1. The bids are listed in alphabetical order. The number to the left of the total for each contract (A, B, and Combination) indicates the ranking from low to high.
2. Highlighting indicates a math error.

CONTRACT A: WATERLINE REPLACEMENT

CONTRACT B: CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIRS

T.R. Snyder ConstructionD.L. Smith Concrete Palmer & Son ExcavatingLiberta Construction
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