WOOSTER CITY COUNCIL AGENDA
November 3, 2014
7:30 p.m.

The meeting will be held at City Hall, in Council Chambers, 1* Floor, 538 N. Market Street,
Wooster, Ohio.

¥, ROLL CALL & ORDERING OF AGENDA

IL. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

III. COMMUNICATIONS FROM MAYOR/ADMINISTRATION

IV. PETITIONS/COMMUNICATIONS FROM PUBLIC

Liquor License notice regarding a request for a transfer of C1 and C2 class permits from JJMAC LLC,
DBA Convenient Food, 337 W. Liberty St., Wooster, Ohio 44691 to Bettys Boy LLC, DBA Convenient
Food Market, 337 W. Liberty St., Wooster, Ohio 44691.

V. COMMITTEE REPORTS; PUBLIC HEARINGS

VI OLD BUSINESS

VII. NEW BUSINESS

1. First Reading — ORDINANCE NO. 2014-30 AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 1351,
MINIMUM HOUSING STANDARDS AND PROPERTY MAINTENANCE
CODE, OF THE CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF WOOSTER,
OHIO, TO UPDATE THE CODE (Knapic)

2. First Reading — ORDINANCE NO. 2014-31 AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 1311,
APPEALS, OF THE CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
WOOSTER, OHIO, TO UPDATE THE CODE (Knapic)

3. First Reading — ORDINANCE NO. 2014-32 AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE ANNUAL
APPROPRIATION ORDINANCE (Ansel)

4. First Reading — RESOLUTION NO. 2014-65 A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE
PAYMENT OF EXPENSES RELATED TO PENDING LITIGATION TO
RECOVER DAMAGES FOR WORK DONE AT THE WASTEWATER
TREATMENT PLANT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY (Sanders)

VIII. MISCELLANEOUS
IX. ADJOURNMENT



OHIO DIVISION OF LIQUOR CONTROL

NOTICE TO LEGISLATIVE 6606 TUSSING ROAD, P.0. BOX 4005
AUTHORITY REYNOLDSBURG, OHIO 43068-9005
(614)644-2360 FAX(614)644-3166
TO
0674147 TRFO BETTYS BOY LLC
EEEMIT NUMEER wee [ DBA CONVENIENT FOOD MARKET

02 |01 [2014 337 W LIBERTY ST

153LE DaT WOOSTER OHIO 44691
10 (20 [2014

FIING DATE
Cl cC2

PERMIT CLASSES

85 165 P F12976

TAX DISTRICT RECEIPT NQ

FREM 10 /22372014

4290900 JIMAC LLC
S BN et DBA CONVENIENT FOOD
02 |01 [2014 337 W LIBERTY ST
ISUE DATE WOOSTER OHIO 44691
10 [20 (2014
cl. 2 . me,mwwwgwﬁ;w?-{s‘:~(“
65 | iNELEL YIS IN
85TAX D]I.S'glET RECEIPT NQ {D .——[:-—; L= . i\ \I. i

I U
ocT 27 2014 |1Y)

L

MAILED 10/22/2014 RESPONSES MUST BE POSTMARKED NO LATER THAN. 11/24/2014

IMPORTANT NOTICE
PLEASE COMPLETE AND RETURN THIS FORM TO THE DIVISION OF LIQUOR CONTROL
WHETHER OR NOT THERE IS A REQUEST FOR A HEARING.
REFER TO THIS NUMBER IN ALL INQUIRIES

B TRFO 0674147

(TRANSACTION & NUMBER)

(MUST MARK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING)

WE REQUEST A HEARING ON THE ADVISABILITY OF ISSUING THE PERMIT AND REQUEST THAT
THE HEARING BE HELD (1IN OUR COUNTY SEAT. [1IN COLUMBUS.

WE DO NOT REQUEST A HEARING. [ ]
DID YOU MARK A BOX? IF NOT, THIS WILL BE CONSIDERED A LATE RESPONSE.

PLEASE SIGN BELOW AND MARK THE APPROPRIATE BOX INDICATING YOUR TITLE:

iSignature) (Title)-[] Clerk of County Commissioner (Date)
[ clerk of City Council

D Township Fiscal Officer

CLERK OF WOOSTER CITY COUNCIL
538 N MARKET ST

PO BOX 1128

WOOSTER OHIO 44691

OLC 4052 REV. 03/09



LLC / PARTNERSHIP CROSS REFERENCE PGECG

DISPLAY

0674147 PERMIT NBR

BETTYS BOY LLC

DBA CONVENIENT FOOD MARKET
337 W LIBERTY ST

WOOSTER OHIO 44691

LR i SR e S e e e R I O S N SIS SN S S S SN S

'ROBERT F LALONDE 10/20/2014 ACTIVE PRESIDENT MAN-MBR

PA2-KEY = END SESSION, CLEAR-KEY = END OPTION, ENTER-KEY = TO CONTINUE



ORDINANCE NO. 2014-30

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 1351, MINIMUM
HOUSING STANDARDS AND PROPERTY MAINTENANCE
CODE, OF THE CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
WOOSTER, OHIO, TO UPDATE THE CODE

WHEREAS, the chief building official recommends the adoption of an updated property
maintenance code for that presently in effect within the municipality.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
WOOSTER, OHIO:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 1351, Minimum Housing Standards and Property
Maintenance Code, of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Wooster, Ohio is hereby amended
to read as follows:

1351.01 ADOPTION OF CODE.

Except as may otherwise be provided hereinafter, the International Property Maintenance
Code, 200612 edition, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as
the Housing Code of the City for the control of buildings, structures, equipment and exterior
property, as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of the International Property Maintenance Code, 200612 edition, are hereby referred
to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out at length in this chapter with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed herein. A copy of such Code shall be on file
with and available for public inspection in the office of the Chief Building Official.

1351.02 APPEAL.

Any person affected by a decision or order issued under this chapter by the Code Official
shall have the right to appeal to the Board of Building and Zoning Appeals, provided that a
written application for appeal is filed within twenty (20) calendar days after the day of the
decision or order was served. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true
intent of the Code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the
provisions of the Code do not fully apply, or the requirements of the Code are adequately
satisfied by other means. The Division shall serve written notice, personally or by registered or
certified mail, upon the appellant of the time, place and date of the hearing on the appeal, and the
' same be set for the next regular meeting of the Board of Buildin g and Zoning Appeals, providing
that such date permits two days’ notice thereof to the appellant. Failure to appear at the hearing
shall be deemed to be a waiver of the appeal, unless prior thereto, the appellant has, through the
Division, requested and received a continuance.

1351.03 ASSESSMENT OF COSTS BY MUNICIPALITY. [No changes]

1351.05 AMENDMENTS.
The International Property Maintenance Code adopted in Section 1351.01 shall be
modified by the adoption of the following provisions set forth herein:




(a) 101.1 Title shall be amended by the insertion of the words [the City of Wooster].

(b)  103.5 Fees shall be amended by the insertion of the words [the Building Standards
Division fee schedule].

(c) 112.4 Failure to comply shall be amended by the insertion of the words [100 dollars]
and [500 dollars].

(d) 302.4 Weeds shall be amended by the insertion of the words [twelve inches].

(e) 304.14 Insect screens shall be amended by the insertion of the words [April 1] and
[October 30].

(f)  504.3 Plumbing system hazards shall be amended by the addition of the following;
All backflow prevention assemblies shall be tested at least annually. The owner or
owner’s representative shall cause the applicable test and keep records of the tests and
shall submit such records to the building official upon request.

(g) 602.3 Heat supply shall be amended by the insertion of the words [January 1] and
[December 31].

(h)  602.4 Occupiable work spaces shall be amended by the insertion of the words
[January 1] and [December 31].

(1)  Appendix A Boarding Standard is adopted under this chapter.

1351.99 PENALTY.

Whoever violates any provision of the Minimum Housing Standards and Property
Maintenance Code adopted under this chapter shall be fined not mere-less than one hundred
dollars ($100.00), nor more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or imprisoned not more than
ninety days, or both. No person shall be imprisoned under this Section 1351.99 for a first
offense, and the prosecution shall always be as and for a first offense unless the affidavit upon
which prosecution is instituted contains the allegation that the offense is a second or repeated
offense.

SECTION 2. This Council finds and declares that all formal actions concerning and
relating to the adoption of this Ordinance occurred in an open meeting of this Council or its
committees, in compliance with law.

SECTION 3. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after the
earliest date allowed by law.

Ist reading 2nd reading 3rd reading
Passed: ,2014 Vote:
Attest:
Clerk of Council President of Council
Approved: ,2014
Mayor

Introduced by: Barbara Knapic




Request for Agenda Item
Non-Capital

Division| Building Standards / Planning Meeting Date Requested | November 3. 2014

Update Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code Approved for Agenda

Project Name

Description (be as descriptive as possible, given space limitations)

We want to adopt the 2012 International Property Maintenance Code (IMPC) referenced in Chapter
1351 Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code. Currently we are enforcing the
2006 International Property Maintenance Code. Also, there are related changes to the ordinances that
discuss the appeals process for the Property Maintenance Code that are affected and must be chan ged.

The 2012 IPMC is an improvement over the 2006 version because it has more specific descriptions and
requirements. There is vast improvement for identifying dangerous structures or premises and the
authority of the code official in those cases. Provisions were put in place for stop work orders and
alternative methods for boarding buildings that need demolished or repaired. An Appendix was created
to specify the process for boarding structures. Nine definitions were added to Chapter 2. Two sections
were added to Chapter 3 to provide a better way of identifying and defining unsafe exterior structure and
component conditions. Occupancy limitations were updated in Chapter 4 to help ensure proper
calculation for habitable living conditions. Chapter 5 added two sections to increase the safe and sanitary
condition for many structures including public toilet facility maintenance and access regulations as well
as grease interceptor and backflow valve regulations. These updates will help the code official be more
effective when identifying and resolving property maintenance issues.

Chapter 1351 Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code also has an appeal
section. Appeals are made to the Board of Building and Zoning Appeals. Wording needs to be updated
in two chapters: Chapter 1351 Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code and
Chapter 1311 Appeals (Building Code).

Is there a need for rules suspension or time limitation when this must be passed?

No.
. 1 A
Manager Requesting Tim Monea/Andrew Dutton
.2014
Date October 9

Approved for Agenda

Ocd %% 3




ORDINANCE NO. 2014-31

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 1311, APPEALS, OF THE

CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF WOOSTER, OHIO, TO
UPDATE THE CODE

WHEREAS, the chief building official recommends the adoption of certain amendments to
Chapter 1311, which governs appeals to the Board of Building and Zoning Appeals.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WOOSTER,
OHIO:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 1311, Appeals, of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Wooster,
Ohio is hereby amended to read as follows:

1311.01 BOARD OF BUILDING AND ZONING APPEALS
(a)

“Board”. The Board of Building and Zoning Appeals is hereby designated as the appeals
board for any and all matters within the jurisdiction of the Division of Building Standards
concerning the Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code; one, two
and three family dwellings:-and-trade contractors™tieenses, except as may be otherwise

specifically desngnated by one or more of the codes and ordmances within such jurisdiction.




1311.032 APPEAL AND REVIEW: FEE,

Any person affected by a decision of the code official or a notice or order issued under any
applicable code shall have the right to appeal such decision, notice or order, provided that the appeal is
filed with the Division within twenty calendar days of the day on which the decision, notice or order was
served. The-application-fee-for-an-appeal-shatl-be-twenty-five-delars($25.00)-and-the application for
appeal shall be based upon a claim that the true intent of the code or rules adopted thereunder has been
incorrectly interpreted; or that the provisions of the code do not fully apply; or that the requirements of
the code are adequately satisfied by other means. The Division shall transmit the file relating to the
matter to the Board of Building and Zoning Appeals and shall be represented at the hearing of the appeal
by a member of the D1v1310n as the Dlrector may direct. H%e—&w&ea—sh&l—l—sewewreﬁw

) e . iy e
W%Wﬁé&&e—e*ped&&he&myw%&me&l—The appellant may appear and be
heard in person or by counsel Fathireto-

SECTION 2. This Council finds and declares that all formal actions concerning and relating to
the adoption of this Ordinance occurred in an open meeting of this Council or its committees, in
compliance with law.

SECTION 3. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after the earliest date
allowed by law.

Ist reading 2nd reading 3rd reading
Passed: ,2014  Vote:
Attest:
Clerk of Council President of Council
Approved: ,2014
Mayor

Introduced by: Barbara Knapic




Request for Agenda Item
Non-Capital

Division| Building Standards / Planning Meeting Date Requested | November 3, 2014

Update Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code Approved for Agenda

Project Name

Description (be as descriptive as possible, given space limitations)

We want to adopt the 2012 International Property Maintenance Code (IMPC) referenced in Chapter
1351 Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code. Currently we are enforcing the
2006 International Property Maintenance Code. Also, there are related changes to the ordinances that
discuss the appeals process for the Property Maintenance Code that are affected and must be changed.

The 2012 IPMC is an improvement over the 2006 version because it has more specific descriptions and
requirements. There is vast improvement for identifying dangerous structures or premises and the
authority of the code official in those cases. Provisions were put in place for stop work orders and
alternative methods for boarding buildings that need demolished or repaired. An Appendix was created
to specify the process for boarding structures. Nine definitions were added to Chapter 2. Two sections
were added to Chapter 3 to provide a better way of identifying and defining unsafe exterior structure and
component conditions. Occupancy limitations were updated in Chapter 4 to help ensure proper
calculation for habitable living conditions. Chapter 5 added two sections to increase the safe and sanitary
condition for many structures including public toilet facility maintenance and access regulations as well
as grease interceptor and backflow valve regulations. These updates will help the code official be more
effective when identifying and resolving property maintenance issues.

Chapter 1351 Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code also has an appeal
section. Appeals are made to the Board of Building and Zoning Appeals. Wording needs to be updated
in two chapters: Chapter 1351 Minimum Housing Standards and Property Maintenance Code and
Chapter 1311 Appeals (Building Code).

Is there a need for rules suspension or time limitation when this must be passed?

No.
Manager Requesting Tim Monea/Andrew Dutton
Date October 9, 2014

Approved for Agenda

Ocd %% 3)



ORDINANCE NO. 2014-32

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE ANNUAL
APPROPRIATION ORDINANCE

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Wooster adopted an Annual Appropriation
Ordinance No. 2013-43 for Fiscal Year 2014, and from time-to-time it becomes necessary to
amend that Ordinance.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
WOOSTER, OHIO:

SECTION 1. In order to pay for costs associated with utilizing outside counsel in pending
litigation, the amount of $115,000.00 is hereby appropriated from the unappropriated balance in
the General Fund, to be allocated as follows:

1. Walter Haverfield — taxpayer litigation (2 cases), and litigation support
(Enviroclean)
Taft, Stettinius, Hollister — council of governments matters
Frost, Brown, Todd — ODNR Appeal
Mark Baserman — Enviroclean nuisance case
Kastner, Westman, Wilkins — labor negotiations

A S

Additionally, the director of finance is hereby authorized to issue payment to the above-
referenced firms for services rendered in connection with the referenced matters.

SECTION 2. This Council finds and declares that all formal actions concerning and
relating to the adoption of this Ordinance occurred in an open meeting of this Council or its
committees, in compliance with law.

SECTION 3. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after the
earliest date allowed by law.

1st reading 2nd reading 3rd reading
Passed: ,2014 Vote:
Attest:
Clerk of Council President of Council
Approved: ,2014
Mayor

Introduced by: Jon Ansel




RESOLUTION NO. 2014-65

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PAYMENT OF EXPENSES
RELATED TO PENDING LITIGATION TO RECOVER DAMAGES
FOR WORK DONE AT THE WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, in Res. 2014-02 this Council authorized the city administration to institute legal
proceedings in order to pursue potential claims for damages in connection with upgrades that were
performed at the wastewater treatment plant during 2007; and

WHEREAS, in connection therewith this Council authorized the engagement of outside counsel,
McMahon DeGulis, an environmental law firm, to represent the City’s interests; and

WHEREAS, apart from attorney fees, which were established in Res. 2014-02, it is necessary to
reimburse McMahon DeGulis for certain expenses related to the litigation, including litigation support
services, the services of expert witnesses and expenses related to discovery (interrogatories, depositions,
document production, and the like).

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WOOSTER,
OHIO:

SECTION 1. That the director of finance is hereby authorized to reimburse McMahon DeGulis
for expenses related to the litigation to recover damages for work done at the wastewater treatment plant.

SECTION 2. The cost of such expenses will not exceed $200,000.00, which amount is hereby
appropriated from the unappropriated balance in the Water Pollution Control Fund.

SECTION 3. This Council finds and declares that all formal actions concerning and relating to
the adoption of this resolution occurred in an open meeting of this Council, in compliance with law.

SECTION 4. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure necessary to the
immediate preservation of the public health, peace, safety and welfare of the City, or providing for the
usual daily operation of a municipal department or division, and for the further reason that prompt action
is necessary to reimburse outside counsel for costs expended in connection with the litigation; wherefore,
this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and immediately after its passage and approval by the
Mayor; provided it receives the affirmative vote of at least three-fourths of the members of the Council;
otherwise it shall take effect and be in force from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

1st reading 2nd reading 3rd reading
Passed: ,2014 Vote:
Attest:
Clerk of Council President of Council
Approved: ,2014
Mayor

Introduced by: Craig Sanders






